
Non Disclosure Agreement (NDA) 

This non disclosure agreement is entered into on _______day of_____________ by and            
between ​DHIndia Association, located at 14 Wheeler Road, Frazer Town, Bangalore           
(“DHIndia”) and _______________ having their address at       
____________________(​“Team member”​). 

DHIndia acknowledges the Team member may receive information regarding the DHIndia’s           
business, practices, or other properties that may be considered confidential. Therefore, the            
Parties are in agreement to the following terms and conditions of this agreement. 

Confidentiality 

For the duration of this non disclosure agreement, any information the Team member may              
come into contact with that is not public knowledge and is made only available through               
contact with the DHIndia shall be deemed as confidential information. 

This includes any information in regards to vendors, pricing, technology, software, or            
product. 

The Team member should use common judgment when deciding if information is            
confidential and above all else shall request approval from the DHIndia prior to the release of                
any questionable information. 

Confidentiality Protection 

The Team member understands that the information deemed confidential is of value to the              
DHIndia or it’s associates and shall hold all information at the same level of confidentiality as                
personal information is held. 

The Team member agrees to hold all confidential information made available to standard             
non disclosure terms and will not make said information available or disclose said             
information to third party vendors or individuals without the DHIndia’s prior written consent. 

The Team member shall under no circumstances modify or copy confidential information that             
is made available to them. 

Unauthorized disclosure 

In the event any information is found to be disclosed by the Team member without prior                
written approval from the DHIndia, the DHIndia will be permitted to seek remedies including,              
but not limited to legal assistance and termination of this agreement. 

Return of Information 

Upon the conclusion or termination of this agreement the Team member agrees to return              
any information deemed confidential and in relation to this non disclosure agreement. 

Any information that is unable to be returned must be destroyed immediately following the              
termination or conclusion of this non disclosure agreement. 



 

License to Use 

The Team member shall be permitted to use any and all information or products provided by                
the DHIndia strictly in the form such property is permitted. 

Furthermore all property provided to the Team member shall remain the DHIndia’s property             
and shall be treated as such. 

Entirety 

This non disclosure agreement shall serve as the entire agreement between the Parties and              
shall prevail over any prior agreements conducted in written or oral form by the Parties. 

Term 

The obligations of this non disclosure agreement shall survive indefinitely including through            
termination or conclusion of this agreement. 

Assignment 

The Parties agree to abstain from the sale, transferring, or delegating of any provisions of               
this agreement to third party individuals without the prior written consent of the responding              
party. 

Any third party individuals entered into this agreement shall be bound by all the terms and                
conditions contained within this agreement as so. 

Jurisdiction 

This non disclosure agreement shall fall under the jurisdiction of India, furthermore all legal              
proceedings occurring in relation to this agreement shall be conducted as such. 

Agreement 

Under these special circumstances, by mentioning your name in the below signature space,             
the Parties acknowledge and agree to any and all provisions included in this non disclosure               
agreement.  

 

For DHIndia Team member  

 

Signature: Signature:  

Dr. Pramod D Jacob Dr/Mr/Ms. Abc def 
CEO, DHIndia Association XYZ org 


